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TWO STRONG PARTNERS UNDER ONE ROOF

YEARS OF EXPERIENCE WITH 
STOCK EXCHANGE SOFTWARE

WE WORK ON THE FUTURE – 
NEXXCHANGE GOLF SUITE

WEB BASED AND FULLY INTEGRATED

FULL SECURITY, FULL SERVICE

International statistics show that SaaS (Software as a Service) 
is virtually fail-safe. Should an unlikely fault or error occur, we 
are completely prepared through our safety structure. The 
GolfSuite works behind the scenes with a guaranteed availa-
bility of 99.5% and a double mirrored database in two different 
data centers. Moreover, all customer data are saved by us every 
day on external hard-discs.

This cost-effective service by Nexxchange offers a wide range 
of benefi ts: Customer Relationship Management (management 
of members); management for plant operators; tee time online 
reservations; tournaments; POS; dynamic memberships and 
their handling, as well as agent modules (regional concept) 
and more.

Nexxchange is a technology enterprise that focuses on op-
timising commercial processes for the playing of golf. These 
include the administration of memberships, tournaments, POS 
cash register systems, tee time bookings and much more. Our 
software solutions for booking engine are certifi ed by the Aus-
tria Golf Federation and the Italian Golf Federation and achie-
ve high performance rates at low costs. The B2B solutions of 
Nexxchange are distinguished by the Software as a Service 
concept.

xTradeSoft GmbH, Vienna, is an Austrian subsidiary of Nexxch-
ange. As an outsource-software inhouse development com-
pany, xTradeSoft is responsible for creating and implementing 
specifi c software solutions. Since 1994, xTradeSoft has been 
successful in software development around the world. The 
roster of customers include the stock exchanges in Kuwait 
and Lima, Peru, as well as securities brokerages in the Middle 
East. Structurally, both enterprises are connected under the 
Nexxchange roof.

xTradeSoft developed the Kuwait Automated Retrieval System 
(KARS), which provides market information in real time - the-
reby enabling investors to connect with the market. Based on 
customer demands, software with Linux, MS-SQL, Java and a 
graphical user interface from Microsoft Windows as compo-
nents was built with a custom-made library. 

For the Kuwait Middle East Financial Investment Company 
(KMEFIC), xTradeSoft created and implemented the fi rst E-tra-
ding page, ‘Alawsat.com’, in 2000-2001. And for the National 
Investments Company (NIC), a fully operable E-trading solu-
tion was developed by xTradeSoft in 2008 and implemented 
in 2009.

As our name indicates – Nexxchange stands for Next Exchan-
ge – we are at the forefront of sophisticated IT solutions that 
provide for networking with the customers.

With the newest technologies, we work on our main target - es-
tablishing ‘Hospitality 4.0’ on the golf course - and to provide all 
of the business processes of the operator as fully integrated in 
a comprehensive solution. We simplify and automate business 
processes and enable the golf players and business partners 
to experience easily, for themselves, the user-friendly system 
with a responsive web design.

Rapidly increasing digitalisation presents new challenges for 
the leisure and tourism sector. Consolidated tee times for entire 
regions and special network offers in cooperation with hotel 
operators have a very bright future.

Our IT technologies establish appropriate standards, for ex-
ample, with the modern regional-booking-portal. It allows 
businesses to not only manage their dynamic company mem-
berships, but also to include hotels and travel agencies directly 
in the golf tee times booking process.

Based on more than 20 years of experience with time critical 
applications for the stock exchange operations, xTradeSoft has 
been developing ‘GolfSuite’, the web based and fully integra-
ted golf club management software, since 2012. Nexxchange 
offers software as a full service to golf clubs – to cover in one 
solution all of the process requirements. The Nexxchange 
GolfSuite takes over all applications related to golf club ma-
nagement.

Therefore, the purchase of databases and computer servers, 
and the buying of licenses or software updates is completely 
unnecessary. Internet access – whether via desktop, tablet or 
laptop - is the only requirement. The new user-based price 
model for the Suite lies far below the total costs of the other 
client-server providers.
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